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OCTOBER 24, 2021


Hi, church! Here are some ways we 
can be preparing to gather for church 
on Sunday:


PRAY


Would you thank God for allowing us 
to rent and use Tradewind 
Elementary School for church each 
week? 


Would you pray that God would 
prepare you to worship Him, hear 
from Him, and be transformed by 
Him this Sunday morning?


SING


Along with the doxology we sing 
every week, this week, we'll sing:


• Before the Throne of God Above

• Our God Saves

• This I Believe

• Resurrecting

• Lord, I Need You


Consider looking up the lyrics to 
these songs or listening to them this 
weekend before we gather to 
worship.


Listen on Apple Music here.

Listen on Spotify here.




READ


We'll continue our sermon series in 
the book of James. Our sermon text 
this Sunday is James 2:14-17. 




GIVE


We give our tithes and offerings each 
week as a response to all that God 
has given us – most importantly, His 
Gospel!


TCC's online giving is here; or prepare 
to give in person on Sunday at the 
kiosk in the back of the cafetorium.




INVITE


Who could you invite today to come 
to church with you this week?




Thanks! See you on Sunday!


BRAD NEWMAN

Pastor

Tradewind Community Church

806-290-1979

brad@tccamarillo.com

https://www.youtube.com/watch?v=-vOW0EU1Gs0
https://music.apple.com/us/playlist/tcc-sunday/pl.u-PDb44vBsGVR1JK
https://open.spotify.com/playlist/6wv93fBuNGLVef0QhLVZ91?si=EsrtScfXQNupYpHdlXwIfg
http://tccamarillo.com/james
http://tccamarillo.com/give
mailto:brad@tccamarillo.com

